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We appreciated the Anonymous Referee #2 comments and believe that addressing
these comments will improve the quality of the manuscript.

The main concern of the Reviewer is that the manuscript does not take into account
some previous works related to the uncertainty of river flow data. Unfortunately, the
Reviewer only cited some authors without including any specific reference to these
works. It is our belief that the majority of the previous studies focused on uncertainty
of direct river discharge measurements, that is, those taken by measuring the flow
velocity and the cross sectional area. Our study analysed the uncertainty of the river
flow estimated by using the rating curve method (that we believe it is the most used in
practice) by investigating several sources of uncertainty (measurements, interpolation,
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extrapolation, roughness changes and unsteady flow). Nevertheless, we acknowledge
that the discussion of previous works is now too concise. Thus, besides the papers
already quoted in the original manuscript (Arico’ et al., 2008; Clarke, 1999; Franchini
et al., 1999; European ISO EN Rule 748, 1997; Pelletier, 1987; Petersen-Overleir,
2004), the revised version of the manuscript will discuss other works (e.g. Herschy,
1978; Kuczera, 1996; Pappenberger et al., 2006; Sivapragasam et al., 2005; Yu, 2000;
see below, ADDITIONAL REFERENCES). Also, we will take into account the studies
of the authors cited by the Reviewer (e.g. Sauer and Meyer, 1992; Schmidt, 2002;
Harmel and Smith, 2007; see below, ADDITIONAL REFERENCES). Discussing the
previous studies will allow us to highlight the original contribution of our work which,
in our opinion, is in fact related to uncertainty analysis of the rating curve method by
investigating several sources of uncertainty.

The Reviewer raises also another important issue, by saying that "the analysis is re-
stricted to the particular case of the Po River". We do not agree with the Reviewer
on this point. A quantitative uncertainty analysis does need the use of a specific test
site. Our study focused on the longest and most important river in Italy, which can be
considered representative of the conditions of many important rivers in Europe. Also,
the proposed methodology is general and can be easily calibrated and applied to other
test sites. We will make this point clear in the revised manuscript.

Finally the Reviewer gave a technical correction that will be addressed in the revised
version of the manuscript.
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