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Many thanks for these constructive comments on the ms. Please find my replies on
specific topics below:

Bias towards presenting examples from landscape ecology and applying them
on to hydrology

This bias is due to the discussion between the author and several hydrologists underly-
ing this manuscript. As a landscape ecologist, who already applies hydrological models
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to improve ecological predictions (see example 2; Rudner et al. in press; Schröder et
al. 2004), the reverse question - how can landscape ecology improve hydrological pre-
dictions? - seemed to be more challenging (but see Schröder and Seppelt in press).
Naturally, I’m more familiar with landscape ecological concepts. I hope that this bias will
be removed due to the revision with respect to ecohydrological research in semi-arid
landscapes which was suggested by the other two reviewers.

Structure in section 2

This part of the manuscript will be restructured and changed according to the sugges-
tions of all reviewers. Adding a further section on ecohydrological research in semi-arid
landscapes will improve and broaden the focus of the review. Additional examples will
shift the focus from patterns to processes and feedbacks, and offer a more complete
picture of the state-of-the-art research in the interdisciplinary field of ecohydrology - as
suggested by all three reviewers. They will also more substantially represent integrated
process-based models and reveal their relevance.

Figure 2

Fig. 2 shows how the consideration of predictors related to hydrology - such as the
amount of plant available water - improves model performance in terms of model cali-
bration (R2N) and discrimination (AUC) depending on model complexity (i.e. the num-
ber of predictors variables). The presented scatterplot reveals that both performance
criteria are improved. This improvement is i) higher for simpler models and ii) higher
than could be expected due the increasing model complexity and related additional
information. There is some additional information necessary to understand the figure
that is presented in the referred paper (Rudner et al. in press, Schröder et al subm.)
but will be given in the revised ms. As an additional information species names will be
given. To make the figure easier to interpret, I’ll present only one performance criterion
(R2N) as a bar plot. It should be noted that only 15 out of 50 species significantly
depend on plant available water, i.e. 35 may do in the univariate case but not in the
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multiple models. The underlying overall model performance is considerably high. The
example will be accompanied by comparable studies using hydrological information for
the prediction of species or species richness distribution (e.g. Zinko et al. 2005 or
large-scale bioclimatic species distribution models, e.g. Araújo et al. 2005).

Wavelets

Wavelets receive increasing awareness in landscape ecology (see below) as well as in
hydrology (see Gaucherel 2002; Labat 2005; Markovic and Koch 2005; Si and Zeleke
2005). Instead of extending this section by methodological issues, I will replace some
of the cited references and refer to wavelet-related references in the landscape ecolog-
ical literature (Bradshaw and Spies 1992; Camarero et al. 2006, Keitt 2000; Keitt and
Urban 2005; Saunders et al. 1998; Schröder and Seppelt in press).

All suggestions concerning title, subtitles and structure in section 2, spelling and style
will be taken into account in the revised manuscript.
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